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Compulsory REVISION comments 
 

 

• The paper looks interesting but the title is 
not as attractive as it should be. Author 
should try to modify the title if possible to 
make it more attractive. 

• The author has straight away come to 
results in the abstract without discussing a 
line about dietary palm or cocoyam. Try to 
write a line about these and then come to 
your investigations. 

• The introduction should straight away 
determine the significance of your work and 
not wander or deviate from the main 
objective of the work. Try to precise the 
introduction as much as possible. 

 

Minor REVISION comments 
 

 

• Material and methods are not written as it 
should have been. Modify the material and 
methods part. 

• The results and discussion part is written 
haphazardly and it does not present the 
results in a nice manner. Modify the results 
and discussion part and make some 
subheadings so that it should become easy 
for the reader to understand your work. 

 

Optional/General comments 
 

 

• I think the conclusion should be devoid of 
any references. It should depict what you 
have concluded from the work and that is 
all. 

• Try to strictly write the references as per 
the format of the journal. 
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